
DEPARTMENT OF CONSUMER PROTECTION 
 
 

LIQUOR CONTROL DIVISION 
 
 

MINUTES 
 

 
 
MEETING PLACE:  Commission Meeting Room   -   Room 124 
 
MEETING DATE:  December 18, 2007   -   8:30 a.m. 
 
MEMBERS PRESENT: Angelo J. Faenza, Liquor Control Commissioner 
 
STAFF PRESENT:  Elisa Nahas, Commissioner Designee  

Gerald C. Langlais, Administrator of Liquor Control 
    Jack Suchy, Director of Liquor Control 
    Mary Ellen Gillon, Paralegal Specialist 
     (8:30 a.m.   -   8:37 a.m.) 
    Diana Sedok, Secretary 
 
 
HEARINGS   -   Mary Ellen Gillon: 
 
 
1. YEN TIET, MANH   -   LIR.16985 
  Remove from hearings.  Fire marshal form received. (2007-9139) 
 
2. STONE, AMY   -   LIC.2108 
  Remove from hearings.  Fire marshal form received. (2007-9136) 
 
3. ORTEGA, RAFAEL   -   LGB.12872 

Commission accepts offer in compromise in lieu of hearing of 4 days and  
$1,300 for incident of 7/21/07. (2007-6172) 

 
4. FREIBEL, DAVID   -   LIP.13948 

Commission accepts offer in compromise in lieu of hearing of 3 days and 
$750 for incident of 8/11/07. (2007-6472) 

 
5. SINGH, JASBIR   -   LGB.12797 

Commission accepts offer in compromise in lieu of hearing of 13 days for 
incident of 1/17/06. (2007-7060) 
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6. DEBARROS, CARLOS   -   LCA.6061 

After compliance meeting, commission takes no further action on incident 
of 9/19/06.  (2007-4293) 

 
 
 
 
PROVISIONAL PERMITS: 
 
 
1. FEIJOO, BETTY   -   LIR.17597                                             Paisan’s, Kent 

Ok to issue provisional permit when in receipt of stipulated agreement, 
$500 fee, cancel permit LIR.14047, bill of sale, sellers affidavit, executed 
copy of lease in LLC name, health certificate, copy of sales and use tax 
permit, sales agreement, inventory list, financial affidavit of loan 
documents for $220,000. 

 
2. ALMUNAJED, JAMAL   -   LGB.14230            Omar Food Market, Bridgeport 

Ok to issue provisional permit when in receipt of stipulated agreement, 
$500 fee. 

 
3. PAREKH, KIRAN   -   LIH.1742                                Hilton Garden Inn, Groton 

Ok to issue provisional permit when in receipt of stipulated agreement, 
$500 fee. 

 
4. LAVINE, MELODY   -   LCA.6916                                  Crossroads, Oakdale 

Ok to issue provisional permit when in receipt of stipulated agreement, 
$500 fee, cancel permit LIR.17029, bill of sale, sellers affidavit, health 
certificate. 

 
5. COLEY, KEITH   -   LIP.14402                    Fairfield Wines & Spirits, Fairfield 

Ok to issue provisional permit when in receipt of stipulated agreement, 
$500 fee, cancel permit LIP.13866, bill of sale, sellers affidavit.  Request 
to waive section 30-6-A36(6), wholesalers period of credit, on provisional 
permit approved. 
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FINAL PERMITS: 
 
 
1. FINK, ARNOLD   -   LCT.202     

    Next Generation Vending & Food Services, Hartford 
  No requirements.  Ok to issue final permit. 
 
2. NATH, PRAKASH   -   LIR.17570                                       Ayuthai, Guilford 
  No requirements.  Ok to issue final permit. 
 
3. KOPSTEIN, MICHAEL   -   LIR.17596      FOE an American Bistro, Branford 

Ok to issue final permit when in receipt of publication notice, bill of sale, 
sellers affidavit, cancel old permit LIR.16456, liquor inventory list, copy 
of LLC documents filed with the Secretary of the State Office. 

 
4. RUSSELL, GEORGE   -   LGB.14220                       George’s Deli, Bridgeport 

Assigned to hearing, section 30-20(c), definition of a grocery.  If 
approved, still need publication notice, FEIN, copy of sales and use tax 
permit, bill of sale, sellers affidavit, beer inventory list. 

 
5. TELESCO, ROSEANN   -   LGB.14175          P & R Grocery Store, Waterbury 
  Assigned to hearing, section 30-20(c), definition of a grocery.   
 
6. PATEL, PARUL   -   LGB.14225                 Food Fare Deli & Market, Milford 

Assigned to hearing, section 30-20(c), definition of a grocery.  If 
approved, still need publication notice, bill of sale, sellers affidavit, alien 
registration card or naturalization papers, beer inventory list, cancel old 
permit LGB.12189. 

 
7.  PATEL, SUNILKUMAR   -   LGB.14217                          Krauszer’s, Hamden 

Assigned to hearing, section 30-20(c), definition of a grocery.  If 
approved, still need LLC filing documents, sellers affidavit, copy of sales 
and use tax permit, copy of $139,000 promissory note. 

 
8. GARRIDO, ANGIE   -   LIR.17334                     Capriccio Restaurant, Hartford 

Assigned to hearing, section 30-39, remonstrance.  If approved, still need 
sellers affidavit or abandonment affidavit. 
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9. GOODMAN JR., WELLS   -   LCA.6849                       Café 937, Waterbury 

Assigned to hearing, section 30-39, remonstrance.  If approved, still need 
copy of sales and use tax permit, abandonment affidavit, 8 x 10 photos of 
exterior and furnished interior, copy of loan, completion of application 
(signature page). 

 
 
 
OTHER: 
 
 
 
1. PATEL, PRITESH   -   LIP.14399             Topshelf Wine & Liquor, Waterbury 

Commission approved request to waive section 30-6-A36(b), wholesalers 
period of credit, on provisional permit. 

 
2. HARTLEY & PARKER LTD   -   LIW.512                                 Stratford 
  Commission approved transfer of stock. 
 
3. FU, JIAN   -   LIP.14080                    A & S Discount Liquors, West Hartford 

Commission approved transfer of interest when in receipt of offer in 
compromise in the amount of $750 for violation of section 30-6-A4(a), 
transfer of interest without approval, on 2/14/06. 

 
4. CAP, GEORGE   -   LIR.17077                                         Carmine’s, Bristol 
  Commission approved transfer of interest. 
 
5. PATEL, PRAKASH   -   LIP.14302                             Crazy Grapes, Stamford 
  Commission approved transfer of interest and substitute permittee. 
 
6. RESTIVO, LISA   -   LCA.6597                   Frankie’s Sport Lounge, Bridgeport 
  Commission approved Francisco Cotto as substitute permittee. 
 
7. LACHANCE, JAMES   -   LIR.15389           99 Restaurant & Pub, Wallingford 
  Commission approved Keven B. Crawford as substitute permittee. 
 
8. RUSSELL, ROBERT P.   -   LIC.1719      

     VFW Anderson-Shea Post #2046, Manchester 
  Commission approved Arthur W. Moller as substitute permittee. 
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9. GUERRERA, VICTOR   -   LIC.1855 

Pontelandolfo Community Club, Waterbury 
  Commission approved Philip J. Mancini as substitute permittee. 
 
10. SAJDA, CHESTER   -   LIC.2064     

     Polish American Veterans Assoc. Post #24, Bridgeport 
  Commission approved Zen Porebski as substitute permittee. 
 
11. PATEL, BABUBHAI   -   LGB.13280                   Haven Food Stop, New Haven 
  Commission approved Kanaiyalal Patel as substitute permittee. 
 
12. HOPKINS, CURTIS   -   LIP.12595                         Super Saver Spirit, Shelton 
  Commission approved Paul C. Keenan as substitute permittee. 
 
13. PELLEGRINO, JOHN   -   LIC.2187        Knights of Columbus #4303, Somers 
  Commission approved Jeffrey M. Dion as substitute permittee. 
 
14. KEEFE, LEE   -   LCA.5363                   Manchester Country Club, Manchester 
  Commission approved Andrew Porier as substitute permittee. 
 
15. ARNOLD, ANDREA   -   LCA.5220             Pleasant Moments Café, Bridgeport 

Attorney Jan C. Trendowski’s request in fax dated December 17, 2007 for 
a stay has been denied. (2007-5071) 

 
16. Commission discussed the December 12, 2007 fax request from Elizabeth L. 

Small, of AMF Bowling Centers Inc. regarding selling of alcoholic beverages.  
Gerald C. Langlais to draft letter in response. 

 
Adjourned at 9:25 a.m. 
 
Respectfully submitted, 
 
 
 
Gerald C. Langlais 
Administrator of Liquor Control 
 
ds 


