OAG Template 18



STATE OF CONNECTICUT DEPARTMENT OF SOCIAL SERVICES

CONTRACT AMENDMENT

Contractor: Western Connecticut Area Agency on Aging, Inc.

Contractor Address: 84 Progress LaneWaterbury, CT 06705

Contract Number: 151WCA-CHC-01/13DSS6502CD

Amendment Number: A2

Amount as Amended: \$10,602,776.00

Contract Term as Amended: 07/01/13 - 06/30/18

The contract between Western Connecticut Area Agency on Aging, Inc. (the Contractor) and the Department of Social Services (the Department), which was last executed by the parties and approved by the Office of the Attorney General on 7/6/15, is hereby further amended as follows:

- 1. The total maximum amount payable under this contract is increased by \$4,780,962.00 from \$5,821,814.00 to \$10,602,776.00. This increase is due to the two (2) year extension of the Personal Care Assistance (PCA) Waiver and Care Management services found in Amendment 1, (A1) of the Original Contract and the two (2) year extension of the Connecticut Home Care Program (CHCP) of the Original Contract.
- Part I, SECTION FOUR, labeled OVERVIEW OF PCA WAIVER/CARE MANAGEMENT SUMMARY OF SERVICES, subsection B. labeled TERM of A1 of the Original Contract shall be amended, extending the term of the PCA Waiver Program for two (2) years, from June 30, 2016 to June 30, 2018.
- 3. Page one (1) labeled Contract Term of the Original Contract shall be amended, extending the term of the CHCP for two (2) years, from June 30, 2016 to June 30, 2018.
- 4. Part I, SECTION FOUR labeled THE PCA WAIVER/CARE MANAGEMENT SUMMARY OF SERVICES subsection D. labeled SCOPE OF WORK 6. Contractor Service/Applicant and Client Assessment a. The Contractor shall conduct assessments adhering to specific requirements of A1 of the Original Contract shall be supplemented to include:
 - 5) Complete the assessment process within ten working days of receiving the referral.
 - 6) Request additional time from the Department when more than ten working days are needed to complete the assessment process, including the development of the plan of care, by submitting to the Department in advance.
- 5. Part I, SECTION TWO labeled SCOPE OF WORK A. CONTRACTOR RESPONSIBILITIES 3. Processes for Contractor Eligibility and Client Eligibility c. Applicant and Client Assessments and Reassessments of the Original Contract shall be amended as follows:
 - (17) Complete the assessment process within ten working days of receiving the referral.
 - (18) Request additional time from the Department when more than ten working days are needed to complete the assessment process, including the development of the plan of care, by submitting to the Department in advance:
- Part I, SECTION E. labeled BUDGET AND PAYMENT of A1 of the Original Contract shall be supplemented with the following:

151WCA-CHC-01 / 13DSS6502CD A2

- a. The budget for the services related to the PCA Waiver Program, is supplement to include the period between July 1, 2016 to June 30, 2018, shown on pages six (6) through eight (8) of this agreement.
- 7. Part I, SECTION THREE labeled BUDGET AND PAYMENT of the Original Contract shall be supplemented with the following:
 - a. The budget for the services related to the CHCP, is supplement to include the period between July 1, 2016 to June 30, 2018, shown on pages three (3) through five (5) of this agreement.

WESTERN CONNECTICUT AREA AGENCY ON AGING, INC.

CHCP BUDGET 2016-2017

CYATUR DEMENT				•
STATUS REVIEW				
67 CLIENTS X \$85.00 PER REVIEW		\$	5,695.00	
INITIAL ASSESSMENT FOR NEW CLIENTS				
745 INITIALS X \$259.00 PER ASSESMENT		\$	192,955.00	
DAILY RATE				
1400 CLIENTS 350 DAYS A YEAR		\$ 1	,964,876.00	
TOTAL PROGRAM INCOME		\$ 2	,163,526.00	
PROJECTED EXPENSE				
TOTAL SALARIES				
Director CHCP	73805.68			
Finance Director 20%	15348.67			
Human Resource Director 30%	22822.72			
1 Bookkeeper 60%	22675.16			
3 Supervisors	\$ 188,305.12			
Quality Assurance 85%	\$ 47,005.10			
Benefits Specialist	\$ 41,199.96			
Trainer 72%	\$ 40,168.66			
2 Lead Care Managers	\$ 103,451.95			
19 Care Managers	\$ 938,002.10			
3 Care Manager Assistants	\$ 99,372.17			
2 Support Staff	\$ 27,417.83			
TOTAL SALARIES		\$ 1	,619,575.12	
FICA		\$	123,897.50	
FICA SEP 401K 4%		\$ \$	123,897.50 64,783.00	
SEP 401K 4%		\$	64,783.00	
SEP 401K 4% HEALTH INSURANCE		\$	64,783.00 157,343.00	
SEP 401K 4% HEALTH INSURANCE UNEMPLOYMENT		\$ \$ \$	64,783.00 157,343.00 14,400.00	
SEP 401K 4% HEALTH INSURANCE UNEMPLOYMENT TOTAL FRINGE		\$ \$ \$	64,783.00 157,343.00 14,400.00 360,423.50	
SEP 401K 4% HEALTH INSURANCE UNEMPLOYMENT TOTAL FRINGE COMPUTERS		\$ \$ \$ \$	64,783.00 157,343.00 14,400.00 360,423.50 12,000.00	
SEP 401K 4% HEALTH INSURANCE UNEMPLOYMENT TOTAL FRINGE COMPUTERS TRAVEL		\$ \$ \$ \$	64,783.00 157,343.00 14,400.00 360,423.50 12,000.00 21,000.00	
SEP 401K 4% HEALTH INSURANCE UNEMPLOYMENT TOTAL FRINGE COMPUTERS TRAVEL OFFICE SUPPLIES		\$ \$ \$ \$ \$	64,783.00 157,343.00 14,400.00 360,423.50 12,000.00 21,000.00 13,652.38	
SEP 401K 4% HEALTH INSURANCE UNEMPLOYMENT TOTAL FRINGE COMPUTERS TRAVEL OFFICE SUPPLIES POSTAGE		\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	64,783.00 157,343.00 14,400.00 360,423.50 12,000.00 21,000.00 13,652.38 7,000.00	
SEP 401K 4% HEALTH INSURANCE UNEMPLOYMENT TOTAL FRINGE COMPUTERS TRAVEL OFFICE SUPPLIES POSTAGE TRAINING		\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	64,783.00 157,343.00 14,400.00 360,423.50 12,000.00 21,000.00 13,652.38 7,000.00 4,000.00 7,000.00	
SEP 401K 4% HEALTH INSURANCE UNEMPLOYMENT TOTAL FRINGE COMPUTERS TRAVEL OFFICE SUPPLIES POSTAGE TRAINING TELEPHONE		\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	64,783.00 157,343.00 14,400.00 360,423.50 12,000.00 21,000.00 13,652.38 7,000.00 4,000.00 7,000.00	
SEP 401K 4% HEALTH INSURANCE UNEMPLOYMENT TOTAL FRINGE COMPUTERS TRAVEL OFFICE SUPPLIES POSTAGE TRAINING TELEPHONE PRINTING		\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	64,783.00 157,343.00 14,400.00 360,423.50 12,000.00 21,000.00 13,652.38 7,000.00 4,000.00 7,000.00	
SEP 401K 4% HEALTH INSURANCE UNEMPLOYMENT TOTAL FRINGE COMPUTERS TRAVEL OFFICE SUPPLIES POSTAGE TRAINING TELEPHONE PRINTING ADVERTISING		\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	64,783.00 157,343.00 14,400.00 360,423.50 12,000.00 21,000.00 13,652.38 7,000.00 4,000.00 7,000.00 1,000.00	
SEP 401K 4% HEALTH INSURANCE UNEMPLOYMENT TOTAL FRINGE COMPUTERS TRAVEL OFFICE SUPPLIES POSTAGE TRAINING TELEPHONE PRINTING ADVERTISING CONFERENCE AND TRAINING		\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	64,783.00 157,343.00 14,400.00 360,423.50 12,000.00 21,000.00 13,652.38 7,000.00 4,000.00 7,000.00 1,000.00 1,000.00 2,500.00	
SEP 401K 4% HEALTH INSURANCE UNEMPLOYMENT TOTAL FRINGE COMPUTERS TRAVEL OFFICE SUPPLIES POSTAGE TRAINING TELEPHONE PRINTING ADVERTISING CONFERENCE AND TRAINING JANITORIAL		\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	64,783.00 157,343.00 14,400.00 360,423.50 12,000.00 21,000.00 13,652.38 7,000.00 4,000.00 7,000.00 1,000.00 2,500.00 2,500.00	
SEP 401K 4% HEALTH INSURANCE UNEMPLOYMENT TOTAL FRINGE COMPUTERS TRAVEL OFFICE SUPPLIES POSTAGE TRAINING TELEPHONE PRINTING ADVERTISING CONFERENCE AND TRAINING JANITORIAL MEETINGS		\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	64,783.00 157,343.00 14,400.00 360,423.50 12,000.00 21,000.00 13,652.38 7,000.00 4,000.00 7,000.00 1,000.00 1,000.00 2,500.00 2,500.00 2,000.00	

AUDIT			\$ 3	3,000.00
PROFESSIONAL INSURANCE				5,000.00
				3,527.38
TOTAL EXPENSE			\$2,10	63,526.00
TOTAL PROFIT/LOSS			\$	(0.00)
	снср в	UDGET 2017-2018		
PROJECTED INCOME	0			
STATUS REVIEW				
301 CLIENTS X \$85.00 PER REVIEW			\$	25,585.00
IMITIAL ACCECCATENT FOR NEW CHENTS				
INITIAL ASSESSMENT FOR NEW CLIENTS 789 INITIALS X \$259.00 PER ASSESMENT			\$	204,351,00
192 MILIWITY V STOPIOO LEW MOSESIMEINI			ş	204,33±,00
DAILY RATE				
1510 CLIENTS 350 DAYS A YEAR			\$	2,119,314.00
TOTAL PROGRAM INCOME			\$	2,349,250.00
PROJECTED EXPENSE				
TOTAL SALARIES				
Director CHCP	\$	76,757.91		
Finance Director 20%	\$	15,809.13		
Human Resource Director 30%	\$	23,507.40		
1 Bookkeeper 60%	\$.	23,355.41		
3 Supervisors	\$	193,954.27		
Quality Assurance 85%	\$	48,415.25		
Benefits Specialist	\$	42,435.96		
Trainer 72%	\$	41,373.72		
2 Lead Care Managers	\$	106,555.51		
21 Care Managers	\$	1,060,142.16		
3 Care Manager Assistants	\$	102,353.34		
2 Support Staff	\$	28,240.36		
TOTAL SALARIES			\$	1,762,900.43
FICA			\$	134,861.88
SEP 401K 4%			\$	70,516.02
HEALTH INSURANCE			\$	173,896.67
UNEMPLOYMENT			\$	16,200.00
TOTAL FRINGE			\$	395,474.57
COMPUTERS			\$	12,000.00
TRAVEL			\$	25,000.00
OFFICE SUPPLIES			\$	17,000.00
POSTAGE			\$	7,000.00
TRAINING		·	\$	4,000.00
TELEPHONE			\$	7,000.00

151WCA-CHC-01 / 13DSS6502CD A2

TOTAL DROEIT/LOSS	\$	(0.00)
TOTAL EXPENSE		\$2,349,250.00
	\$	190,875.00
PROFESSIONAL INSURANCE	\$	15,000.00
AUDIT	\$	3,000.00
IT CONSULTANT	\$	15,000.00
RENT	\$	76,875.00
MEETINGS	\$	2,000.00
JANITORIAL	\$	2,500.00
CONFERENCE AND TRAINING	\$	2,500.00
ADVERTISING	\$	1,000.00
PRINTING	\$	1,000.00

WESTERN CONNECTICUT AREA AGENCY ON AGING, INC.

PCA WAIVER BUDGET 2016

JULY 1, 2016-JUNE 30, 2017

		302.	, 2020 10112 00, 2021
PROJECTED INCOME			
INITIAL ASSESSMENT FOR NEV	V CLIENTS		•
20 NEW ASSESSMENTS X \$25	9.57 PER ASSESMENT	\$	5,191.40
STATUS REVIEW			
15 CLIENTS X \$85.85 PER REV	IEW	\$	1,287.75
		•	,
DAILY RATE			
91 CLIENTS X \$3.66 PER DAY X	APPROX 365 DAYS	\$	121,548.85
TOTAL PROGRAM INCOME		\$	128,028.00
PROJECTED EXPENSE			
TOTAL SALARIES			
2 CM 'S			
23% OF AVERAGE OF \$50,000	FOR 12 MONTHS	\$	23,000.00
	24% FRINGE	\$	5,520.00
1 TRAINER			
15% OF \$54,000 PER YEAR		\$	8,100.00
	24% FRINGE	\$	1,944.00
1 QUALITY ASSURANCE			
30% OF \$55,100 PER YEAR		\$	16,530.00
	24% FRINGE	\$	3,967.20
2 PROGRAM ASSISTANTS			
10% OF\$35,000 PER YEAR		\$	7,000.00
•	24% FRINGE	\$	1,680.00
1 SUPERVISOR			
10% OF\$64,000 PER YEAR		\$	6,400.00
	24% FRINGE	\$	1,536.00
1 PROGRAM DIRECTOR			
10% OF \$71,656 PER YEAR		\$	7,165.60
	24% FRINGE	\$	1,719.74
1 FISCAL STAFF	v [*]	•	
10% OF \$30,000 PER YEAR		\$	3,000.00
	24% FRINGE	\$	720.00
TOTAL SALARIES		\$	71,195.60
TOTAL FRINGE		\$	17,086.94
		-	
EXPENSES			* 000 00
COMPUTERS	O FOLKUF	\$	4,000.00
TRAVEL 5800 MILES PER YEAR	(@ .5U IVIILE	\$	2,900.00
OFFICE SUPPLIES		\$	5,000.00
POSTAGE		\$	1,000.00

TOTAL PROFIT/LOSS	\$	(0.00)	
TOTAL EXPENSE	\$1	128,028.00	
	\$	39,745.46	
SATELLITE OFFICE RENT 800 SQ FT. @ 12.00 PER FOOT	\$	-	
PROFESSIONAL INSURANCE	\$	2,345.46	
AUDIT	\$	1,000.00	
IT CONSULTANT	\$	11,000.00	
RENT	\$	7,500.00	٠
OTHER (INCLUDING TRAINING)	\$	5,000.00	

WESTERN CONNECTICUT AREA AGENCY ON AGING, INC.

PCA WAIVER BUDGET 2017 JULY 1, 2017-JUNE 30, 2018

	2018
PROJECTED INCOME	
INITIAL ASSESSMENT FOR NEW CLIENTS	
19 NEW ASSESSMENTS X \$259.57 PER ASSESMENT	\$ 5,191.40
STATUS REVIEW	
16 CLIENTS X \$85.85 PER REVIEW	\$ 1,373.60
DAILY RATE	ı.
100 CLIENTS X \$3.66 PER DAY X APPROX 365 DAYS	\$ 133,593.00
TOTAL PROGRAM INCOME	\$ 140,158.00
PROJECTED EXPENSE	
TOTAL SALARIES	
2.5 CM'S	
23% OF AVERAGE OF \$51,500 FOR 12 MONTHS	\$ 29,967.85 \$
24% FRINGE	7,192.28
1 TRAINER	
15% OF \$55,620 PER YEAR	\$ 8,343.00 \$
24% FRINGE	2,002.32
1 QUALITY ASSURANCE	\$
30% OF \$56,753 PER YEAR	17,025.90
24% FRINGE	\$ 4,086.22
2 PROGRAM ASSISTANTS	
10% OF\$36,050 PER YEAR	\$ 7,210.00 \$
24% FRINGE	1,730.40
1 SUPERVISOR	1
10% OF\$65,920 PER YEAR	\$ 6,592.00
,,	

	\$
24% FRINGE	1,582.08
4 PROCEARA DIRECTOR	
1 PROGRAM DIRECTOR	
400/ OF \$74 F00 PEP VE 4 P	\$
10% OF \$74,522 PER YEAR	7,452.20
	\$
24% FRINGE	1,788.53
1 FISCAL STAFF	
111001001111	\$
10% OF \$30,900 PER YEAR	3,090.00
10% OF \$30,500 FER TEAR	\$
240/ EDINOT	•
24% FRINGE	741.60
•	\$
TOTAL SALARIES	79,680.95
	\$
TOTAL FRINGE	19,123.43
TOTALTAMOL	15,123.43
•	
EXPENSES	
	\$
COMPUTERS	4,000.00
TRAVEL 6000 MILES PER YEAR @ .50	\$
MILE	3,000.00
	\$
OFFICE SUPPLIES	5,000.00
	ś
POSTAGE	1,262.70
1007.02	\$
OTHER	5,000.00
OTHER	\$.
RENT	7,745.46
NLIN I	
TO CONCLUZA SCT	\$
IT CONSULTANT	12,000.00
	\$
AUDIT	1,000.00
	\$
PROFESSIONAL INSURANCE	2,345.46
	\$.
	41,353.62
•	
TOTAL EXPENSE	\$140,158.00
IVIAL ENPENSE	7170,130.00
	\$
TOTAL PROFIT/LOSS	0.00
TOTAL PROFIT/LOSS	0.00

CONNECTICUT STATE ELECTIONS ENFORCEMENT COMMISSION Rev. 1/11 Page 1 of 2



Notice to Executive Branch State Contractors and Prospective State Contractors of Campaign Contribution and Solicitation Limitations

This notice is provided under the authority of Connecticut General Statutes §9-612(g)(2), as amended by P.A. 10-1, and is for the purpose of informing state contractors and prospective state contractors of the following law (italicized words are defined on the reverse side of this page).

CAMPAIGN CONTRIBUTION AND SOLICITATION LIMITATIONS

No state contractor, prospective state contractor, principal of a state contractor or principal of a prospective state contractor, with regard to a state contract or state contract solicitation with or from a state agency in the executive branch or a quasi-public agency or a holder, or principal of a holder of a valid prequalification certificate, shall make a contribution to (i) an exploratory committee or candidate committee established by a candidate for nomination or election to the office of Governor, Lieutenant Governor, Attorney General, State Comptroller, Sectetary of the State or State Treasurer, (ii) a political committee authorized to make contributions or expenditures to or for the benefit of such candidates, or (iii) a party committee (which includes town committees).

In addition, no holder or principal of a holder of a valid prequalification certificate, shall make a contribution to (i) an exploratory committee or candidate committee established by a candidate for nomination or election to the office of State senator or State representative, (ii) a political committee authorized to make contributions or expenditures to or for the benefit of such candidates, or (iii) a party committee.

On and after January 1, 2011, no state contractor, prospective state contractor, principal of a state contractor or principal of a prospective state contractor, with regard to a state contract or state contract solicitation with or from a state agency in the executive branch or a quasi-public agency or a holder, or principal of a holder of a valid prequalification certificate, shall knowingly solicit contributions from the state contractor's or prospective state contractor's employees or from a subcontractor or principals of the subcontractor on behalf of (i) an exploratory committee or candidate committee established by a candidate for nomination or election to the office of Governor, Lieutenant Governor, Attorney General, State Comptroller, Secretary of the State or State Treasurer, (ii) a political committee authorized to make contributions or expenditures to or for the benefit of such candidates, or (iii) a party committee.

DUTY TO INFORM

State contractors and prospective state contractors are required to inform their principals of the above prohibitions, as applicable, and the possible penalties and other consequences of any violation thereof.

PENALTIES FOR VIOLATIONS

Contributions or solicitations of contributions made in violation of the above prohibitions may result in the following civil and criminal penalties:

Civil penalties—Up to \$2,000 or twice the amount of the prohibited contribution, whichever is greater, against a principal or a contractor. Any state contractor or prospective state contractor which fails to make reasonable efforts to comply with the provisions requiring notice to its principals of these prohibitions and the possible consequences of their violations may also be subject to civil penalties of up to \$2,000 or twice the amount of the prohibited contributions made by their principals.

<u>Criminal penalties</u>—Any knowing and willful violation of the prohibition is a Class D felony, which may subject the violator to imprisonment of not more than 5 years, or not more than \$5,000 in fines, or both.

CONTRACT CONSEQUENCES

In the case of a state contractor, contributions made or solicited in violation of the above prohibitions may result in the contract being voided

In the case of a prospective state contractor, contributions made or solicited in violation of the above prohibitions shall result in the contract described in the state contract solicitation not being awarded to the prospective state contractor, unless the State Elections Enforcement Commission determines that mitigating circumstances exist concerning such violation.

The State shall not award any other state contract to anyone found in violation of the above prohibitions for a period of one year after the election for which such contribution is made or solicited, unless the State Elections Enforcement Commission determines that mitigating circumstances exist concerning such violation.

Additional information may be found on the website of the State Elections Enforcement Commission, www.ct.gov/seec. Click on the link to "Lobbyist/Contractor Limitations."

CONNECTICUT STATE ELECTIONS ENFORCEMENT COMMISSION Rev. 1/11 Page 2 of 2



DEFINITIONS

"State contractor" means a person, business entity or nonprofit organization that enters into a state contract. Such person, business entity or nonprofit organization shall be deemed to be a state contractor until December thirty-first of the year in which such contract terminates. "State contractor" does not include a manicipality or any other political subdivision of the state, including any entities or associations duly created by the manicipality or political subdivision of the state, including any entities or associations duly created by the manicipality or political subdivision or subdivision exclusively amongst themselves to further any purpose authorized by statute or charter, or an employee in the executive or legislative branch of state government or a quasi-public agency, whether in the classified or unclassified service and full or part-time, and only in such person's capacity as a state or quasi-public agency employee.

Prospective state contractor" means a person, business entity or nonprofit organization that (i) submits a response to a state contract solicitation by the state, a state agency or a quasi-public agency, or a proposal in response to a request for proposals by the state, a state agency or a quasi-public agency, until the contract has been entered into, or (ii) holds a valid prequalification certificate issued by the Commissioner of Administrative Services under section 4a-100. "Prospective state contractor" does not include a numicipality or any other political subdivision of the state, including any entities or associations duly created by the municipality or political subdivision exclusively amongst themselves to further any purpose authorized by statute or charter, or an employee in the executive or legislative branch of state government or a quasi-public agency, whether in the classified or unclassified service and full or part-time, and only in such person's capacity as a state or quasi-public agency employee.

"Principal of a state contractor or prospective state contractor" means (i) any individual who is a member of the board of directors of, or has an ownership interest of five per cent or more in, a state contractor or prospective state contractor, which is a business entity, except for an individual who is a member of the board of directors of a nonprofit organization, (ii) an individual who is the contractor or prospective state contractor who has managerial or discretionary ensponsibilities with respect to a state contract, (v) the spouse of any state contractor or prospective state contractor of ni individual described in this subparagraph, or (vi) a political committee established or controlled by an individual described in this subparagraph or the business entity or nonprofit organization that is the state contractor or prospective state contractor.

"State contract" means an agreement or contract with the state or any state agency or any quasi-public agency, let through a procurement process or otherwise, having a value of fifty thousand dollars or more, or a combination or series of such agreements or contracts having a value of one hundred thousand dollars or more in a calendar year, for (3) the rendition of services, (ii) the famishing of any goods, material, supplies, equipment or any items of any kind, (iii) the construction, alteration or repair of any public building or public work, (iv) the acquisition, sale or lease of any land or building, (v) a licensing arrangement, or (vi) a grant, loan or loan guarance. "State contract" does not include any agreement or contract with the state, any state agency or any quasi-public agency that is exclusively federally funded, an education loan, a toan to an individual for other than commercial purposes or any agreement or contract between the state or any state agency and the United States Department of the Navy or the United States Department of Defense.

"State contract solicitation" means a request by a state agency or quast-public agency, in whatever form issued, including, but not limited to, an invitation to bid, request for proposals, request for information or request for quotes, inviting bids, quotes or other types of submittals, through a competitive procurement process or another process authorized by law waiving competitive procurement.

"Managerial or discretionary responsibilities with respect to a state contract" means having direct, extensive and substantive responsibilities with respect to the negotiation of the state contract and not peripheral, clerical or ministerial responsibilities.

"Dependent child" means a child residing in an individual's household who may legally be claimed as a dependent on the federal income tax of such individual.

"Solicit" means (A) requesting that a contribution be made, (B) participating in any fund-raising activities for a candidate committee, exploratory committee, political committee or party committee, including, but not limited to, forwarding tickets to potential committee, receiving contributions for transmission to any such committee or bundling contributions, (C) serving as chairperson, treasurer or deputy treasurer of any such committee, or (D) establishing a political committee for the sole purpose of soliciting or receiving contributions for any committee. Solicit does not include: (i) making a contribution that is otherwise permitted by Chapter 155 of the Connecticut General Statutes; (ii) informing any person of a position taken by a candidate for public office or a raiblic official, (iii) notifying the person of any activities of, or contact information for, any candidate for public office, or (w) serving as a member in any party committee or as an officer of such committee that is not otherwise prohibited in this section.

"Subcontractor" means any person, business entity or nonprofit organization that contracts to perform part or all of the obligations of a state contractor's state contract. Such person, business entity or nonprofit organization shall be deemed to be a subcontractor until December thirty first of the year in which the subcontract terminates. "Subcontractor" does not include (i) a municipality or any other political subdivision of the state, including any entities or associations duly created by the manicipality or political subdivision exclusively amongst themselves to further any purpose authorized by statute or charter, or (ii) an employee in the executive or legislative branch of state government or a quast-public agency, whether in the classified or unclassified service and full or part-line, and only in such person's capacity as a state or quast-public agency employee.

"Principal of a subcontractor" means (i) any individual who is a member of the board of directors of, or has an ownership interest of five per cent or more in, a subcontractor, which is a business entity, except for an individual who is a member of the board of directors of a nonprofit organization, (ii) an individual who is employed by a subcontractor, which is no business entity, as president, casturer or executive vice president, (iii) an individual who is the chief executive officer of a subcontractor, which is not a business entity, or if a subcontractor has no such officer, then the officer who duly possesses comparable powers and duties, (iv) an officer or an employee of any subcontractor who has managerial or discretionary responsibilities with respect to a subcontract with a state contractor, (v) the spouse or a dependent child who is eighteen years of age or older of an individual described in this subparagraph, or (vi) a political committee established or controlled by an individual described in this subparagraph or the business entity or nonprofit organization that is the subcontractor.

This document constitutes an amendment to the above numbered contract. All provisions of that contract, except those explicitly amended herein, shall remain in full force and effect.

SIGNATURES AND APPROVALS 151WCA-CHC-01/13DSS6502CD A2

The Contractor IS NOT a Business Associate under the Health Insurance Portability and Accountability Act of 1996 as amended.

Documentation necessary to demonstrate the authorization to sign must be attached.

CONTRACTOR - WESTERN CONNECTICUT AREA AGENCY ON AGING, INC.

Patra	PRESIDENT	6/25/16
Mr. Patrick Bria, President		Date

DEPARTMENT OF SOCIAL SERVICES

Roderick L. Bremby, Commissioner

OFFICE OF THE ATTORNEY GENERAL

ASST. / ASSOC. ATTORNEY GENERAL (Approved as to form)

1/8/16 Date



STATE OF CONNECTICUT GIFT AND CAMPAIGN CONTRIBUTION CERTIFICATION

Written or electronic certification to accompany a State contract with a value of \$50,000 or more, pursuant to C.G.S. §§ 4-250, 4-252(c) and 9-612(f)(2) and Governor Dannel P. Malloy's Executive Order 49.

INSTRUCTIONS:

Complete all sections of the form. Attach additional pages, if necessary, to provide full disclosure about any lawful campaign contributions made to campaigns of candidates for statewide public office or the General Assembly, as described herein. Sign and date the form, under oath, in the presence of a Commissioner of the Superior Court or Notary Public. Submit the completed form to the awarding State agency at the time of initial contract execution and if there is a change in the information contained in the most recently filed certification, such person shall submit an updated certification either (i) not later than thirty (30) days after the effective date of such change or (ii) upon the submittal of any new bid or proposal for a contract, whichever is earlier. Such person shall also submit an accurate, updated certification not later than fourteen days after the twelve-month anniversary of the most recently filed certification or updated certification.

CHECK ONE:	Initial Certification 12 Month Anniversary Update (Multi-year contracts only.)
	Updated Certification because of change of information contained in the most recently filed certification or twelve-month anniversary update.

GIFT CERTIFICATION:

As used in this certification, the following terms have the meaning set forth below:

- "Contract" means that contract between the State of Connecticut (and/or one or more of it agencies or instrumentalities) and the Contractor, attached hereto, or as otherwise described by the awarding State agency below;
- If this is an Initial Certification, "Execution Date" means the date the Contract is fully executed by, and becomes effective between, the parties; if this is a twelve-month anniversary update, "Execution Date" means the date this certification is signed by the Contractor;
- "Contractor" means the person, firm or corporation named as the contactor below;
- 4) "Applicable Public Official or State Employee" means any public official or state employee described in C.G.S. §4-252(c)(1)(i) or (ii);
- 5) "Gift" has the same meaning given that term in C.G.S. § 4-250(1);
- 6) "Principals or Key Personnel" means and refers to those principals and key personnel of the Contractor, and its or their agents, as described in C.G.S. §§ 4-250(5) and 4-252(c)(1)(B) and (C).

I, the undersigned, am a Principal or Key Personnel of the person, firm or corporation authorized to execute this certification on behalf of the Contractor. I hereby certify that, no gifts were made by (A) such person, firm, corporation, (B) any principals and key personnel of the person firm or corporation who participate substantially in preparing bids, proposals or negotiating state contracts or (C) any agent of such, firm, corporation, or principals or key personnel who participates substantially in preparing bids, proposals or negotiating state contracts, to (i) any public official or state employee of the state agency or quasi-public agency soliciting bids or proposals for state contracts who participates substantially in the preparation of bid solicitations or request for proposals for state contracts or the negotiation or award of state contracts or (ii) any public official or state employee of any other state agency, who has supervisory or appointing authority over such state agency or quasi-public agency.

I further certify that no Principals or Key Personnel know of any action by the Contractor to circumvent (or which would result in the circumvention of) the above certification regarding **Gifts** by providing for any other Principals, Key Personnel, officials, or employees of the Contractor, or its or their agents, to make a **Gift** to any Applicable Public Official or State Employee. I further certify that the Contractor made the bid or proposal for the Contract without fraud or collusion with any person.



STATE OF CONNECTICUT CONSULTING AGREEMENT AFFIDAVIT

Affidavit to accompany a bid or proposal for the purchase of goods and services with a value of \$50,000 or more in a calendar or fiscal year, pursuant to Connecticut General Statutes §§ 4a-81(a) and 4a-81(b). For sole source or no bid contracts the form is submitted at time of contract execution.

INSTRUCTIONS:

If the bidder or vendor has entered into a consulting agreement, as defined by Connecticut General Statutes § 4a-81(b)(1): Complete all sections of the form. If the bidder or contractor has entered into more than one such consulting agreement, use a separate form for each agreement. Sign and date the form in the presence of a Commissioner of the Superior Court or Notary Public. If the bidder or contractor has not entered into a consulting agreement, as defined by Connecticut General Statutes § 4a-81(b)(1): Complete only the shaded section of the form. Sign and date the form in the presence of a Commissioner of the Superior Court or Notary Public.

Submit completed form to the awarding State agency with bid or proposal. For a sole source award, submit completed form to the awarding State agency at the time of contract execution.

This affidavit must be amended if there is any change in the information contained in the most recently filed affidavit not later than (i) thirty days after the effective date of any such change or (ii) upon the submittal of any new bid or proposal, whichever is earlier.

AFFIDAVIT: [N	umber of Affidavits Sworn and	Subscribed On This Day:]
a contract, as desc such a contract who	cribed in Connecticut General o is authorized to execute suc	incipal or key personnel of the bidder or contractor awarde Statutes § 4a-81(b), or that I am the individual awarde h contract. I further swear that I have not entered into an intract, except for the agreement listed below:
Consultant's Name	and Title	Name of Firm (if applicable)
Start Date	End Date	Cost
Description of Servi	ices Provided:	
If YES:Name of Fo	former State employee or form ormer State Agency	Termination Date of Employment
Western Connecticu	it Area Agency	of Principal or Key Personnel Date
	<u>Patrick P</u> Printed Nan	Bria ne (of above) Awarding State Agency
Sworn and subsc	ribed before me on this Comm or Not	day of

My Commission Expires

Rev. 10-01-11



STATE OF CONNECTICUT AFFIRMATION OF RECEIPT OF STATE ETHICS LAWS SUMMARY

C	Vritten or electronic affirmation to accompany a larg ontract, having a cost of more than \$500,000, pursu Olimm and 1-101qq			<i>I</i> -
INST	RUCTIONS:			
	lete all sections of the form. Submit completed for ed below.	n to the awarding State age	ncy or cont	ractor, as
CHEC	K ONE:			
. [I am a person seeking a large State construction affirmation to the awarding State agency with my will be awarded through a competitive process.]	or procurement contract. bid or proposal. [Check the	I am subm is box if the	itting this e contract
	I am a contractor who has been awarded a large submitting this affirmation to the awarding State this box if the contract was a sole source award.]			
Ē	I am a subcontractor or consultant of a contractor or procurement contract. I am submitting this affi	who has been awarded a largmation to the contractor.	ge State co	nstruction
C	I am a contractor who has already filed an affirma no later than thirty (30) days after the effective d of any new bid or proposal, whichever is earlier.	tion, but I am updating such ate of any such change or (ii	affirmation i) upon the	either (i) submittal
IMPO	RTANT NOTE:			
affirm State	n fifteen (15) days after the request of such age ation contractors shall submit the affirmations of the agency. Failure to submit such affirmations in a tin State construction or procurement contract.	ir subcontractors and consult	tants to the	: awarding
AFFII	RMATION:	•		
thereo pursu subco provis	e undersigned person, contractor, subcontractor, conf., affirm (1) receipt of the summary of State ethicant to Connecticut General Statutes § 1-81b and (2 ntractor, or consultant have read and understancions. Summary of State ethics laws is available on the State	cs laws* developed by the C) that key employees of sucl d the summary and agree	Office of St h person, c to comply	ate Ethics contractor, with its
Signa	ture	Date	•	
Dat	rick P, Bria	President		
	d Name	Title		
	tern CT Area Agency on Aging or Corporation (if applicable)	-		
<u>84 P</u>	rogress Lane	Waterbury	_ <u>cr</u>	<u>06705</u>
Stree	t Address	City	State	Zip
		Awarding State Agency		



STATE OF CONNECTICUT
Written or electronic PDF copy of the written certification to accompany a large state contract pursuant to P.A.
No. 13-162 (Prohibiting State Contracts With Entities Making Certain Investments In Iran)

Initial Certification. Amendment or renewal. A. Who must complete and submit this form. Effective October 1, 2013, this form must be submitted for any large state contract, as defined in section 4-250 of the Connecticut General Statutes. This form must always be submitted with the bid or proposal, or if there was no bid process, with the resulting contract, regardless of where the principal place of business is located. Pursuant to P.A. No. 13-162, upon submission of a bid or prior to executing a large state contract, the certification portion of this form must be completed by any corporation, general partnership, limited partnership, limited liability partnership, joint venture,
A. Who must complete and submit this form. Effective October 1, 2013, this form must be submitted for any large state contract, as defined in section 4-250 of the Connecticut General Statutes. This form must always be submitted with the bid or proposal, or if there was no bid process, with the resulting contract, regardless of where the principal place of business is located. Pursuant to P.A. No. 13-162, upon submission of a bid or prior to executing a large state contract, the certification portion of this
contract, as defined in section 4-250 of the Connecticut General Statutes. This form must always be submitted with the bid or proposal, or if there was no bid process, with the resulting contract, regardless of where the principal place of business is located. Pursuant to P.A. No. 13-162, upon submission of a bid or prior to executing a large state contract, the certification portion of this
Pursuant to P.A. No. 13-162, upon submission of a bid or prior to executing a large state contract, the certification portion of this form must be completed by any corporation, general partnership, limited partnership, limited lim
nonprofit organization or other business organization whose principal place of business is located outside of the United States. United States subsidiaries of foreign corporations are exempt. For purposes of this form, a "foreign corporation" is one that is organized and incorporated outside the United States of America.
Check applicable box:
Respondent's principal place of business is within the United States or Respondent is a United States subsidiary of a foreign corporation. Respondents who check this box are not required to complete the certification portion of this form, but must submit this form with its Invitation to Bid ("ITB"), Request for Proposal ("RFP") or contract package if there was no bid process.
Respondent's principal place of business is outside the United States and it is not a United States subsidiary of a foreign corporation. CERTIFICATION required. Please complete the certification portion of this form and submit it with the ITB or RFP response or contract package if there was no bid process.
B. Additional definitions.
 "Large state contract" has the same meaning as defined in section 4~250 of the Connecticut General Statutes; "Respondent" means the person whose name is set forth at the beginning of this form; and "State agency" and "quasi-public agency" have the same meanings as provided in section 1~79 of the Connecticut General Statutes.
C. Certification requirements.
No state agency or quasi-public agency shall enter into any large state contract, or amend or renew any such contract with any Respondent whose principal place of business is located outside the United States and is not a United States subsidiary of a foreign corporation unless the Respondent has submitted this certification.
Complete all sections of this certification and sign and date it, under oath, in the presence of a Commissioner of the Superior Court, a Notary Public or a person authorized to take an oath in another state.
CERTIFICATION:
I, the undersigned, am the official authorized to execute contracts on behalf of the Respondent. I certify that:
Respondent has made no direct investments of twenty million dollars or more in the energy sector of Iran on or after October 1, 2013, as described in Section 202 of the Comprehensive Iran Sanctions, Accountability and Divestment Act of 2010.
☐ Respondent has either made direct investments of twenty million dollars or more in the energy sector of Iran on or after October 1, 2013, as described in Section 202 of the Comprehensive Iran Sanctions, Accountability and Divestment Act of 2010, or Respondent made such an investment prior to October 1, 2013 and has now increased or renewed such an investment on or after said date, or both.
Sworn as true to the best of my knowledge and belief, subject to the penalties of false statement.
Western Connecticut Area Agency on Aging Patrick P. Bria Printed Respondent Name Printed Name of Authorized Official
Signature of Authorized Official Subscribed and acknowledged before me this day of www , 20 4. Commissioner of the Superior Court (or Notary Public) REBECCA P. DOYLE NOTARY PUBLIC My Commissioner of the Superior Court (or Notary Public) REBECCA P. DOYLE NOTARY PUBLIC



STATE OF CONNECTICUT NONDISCRIMINATION CERTIFICATION — <u>Affidavit</u> By Entity

For Contracts Valued at \$50,000 or More

Documentation in the form of an <u>affidavit signed under penalty of false statement by a chief executive officer, president, chairperson, member, or other corporate officer duly authorized to adopt corporate, company, or partnership policy</u> that certifies the contractor complies with the nondiscrimination agreements and warranties under Connecticut General Statutes §§ 4a-60(a)(1) and 4a-60a(a)(1), as amended

INSTRUCTIONS:

For use by an entity (corporation, limited liability company, or partnership) when entering into any contract type with the State of Connecticut valued at \$50,000 or more for any year of the contract. Complete all sections of the form. Sign form in the presence of a Commissioner of Superior Court or Notary Public. Submit to the awarding State agency prior to contract execution.

AFFIDAVIT:

I, the undersigned, am over the age of eighteen (18) and understand and appreciate the obligations of an oath. I am President of Western Connecticut Area Agency on Aging, Inc., an entity duly formed and existing under the laws of the State of Connecticut. I certify that I am authorized to execute and deliver this affidavit on behalf of Western Connecticut Area Agency on Aging, Inc. and that Western Connecticut Area Agency on Aging, Inc. has a policy in place that complies with the nondiscrimination agreements and warranties of Connecticut General Statutes §§ 4a-60(a)(1) and 4a-60a(a)(1), as amended.

Patrick P. Bria

Sworn and subscribed to before me on this 18th day of Mach, 20 16

REBECCA P. DOYLE NOTARY PUBLIC AY COMMISSION EXPIRES JAN. 31, 2019

Commissioner of the Superior Cour

Notary Public

Commission Expiration Date



STATE OF CONNECTICUT

NONDISCRIMINATION CERTIFICATION — <u>New Resolution</u> By Entity

For Contracts Valued at \$50,000 or More

Documentation in the form of a <u>corporate, company, or partnership policy adopted by resolution of the board of directors, shareholders, managers, members or other governing body of a contractor that certifies the contractor complies with the nondiscrimination agreements and warranties under Connecticut General Statutes §§ 4a-60(a)(1) and 4a-60u(a)(1), as amended</u>

INSTRUCTIONS:

For use by an entity (corporation, limited liability company, or partnership) when entering into any contract type with the State of Connecticut valued at \$50,000 or more for any year of the contract. Complete all sections of the form. Submit to the awarding State agency prior to contract execution.

CERTIFICATION OF RESOLUTION:

I, Patrick P. Bria, President of Western Connecticut Area Agency on Aging, Inc., an entity duly formed and existing under the laws of the State of Connecticut, certify that the following is a true and correct copy of a resolution adopted on the _______ 20th____ day of ______ November____, 2015 by the governing body of Western Connecticut Area Agency on Aging, Inc., in accordance with all of its documents of governance and management and the laws of the State of Connecticut and further certify that such resolution has not been modified or revoked, and is in full force and effect.

RESOLVED: That the policies of Western Connecticut Area Agency on Aging, Inc. comply with the nondiscrimination agreements and warranties of Connecticut General Statutes §§ 4a-60(a)(1) and 4a-60a(a)(1), as amended.

The undersigned has executed this certificate this _	day of March Month	, 20 16 Year
Patrick P. Bria	3/18/16 Date	



CHRO Form

State of Connecticut

Commission On Human Rights and Opportunities (CHRO) Workplace Analysis Affirmative Action Report Employee Information Form

White - Not of Hispanic Origin Black - Not of Hispanic Origin Asian - Asian/Pacific Islander

Native - American Indian or Alaskan Native

			¥	Western (UI Area	Agency	on Agin	9				
iD	Job Category	Totals	White Male	White Female	Black Male	Black Female	Hispanic Male	Hispanic Female	Asian Male	Asian Female	Native Male	Native Female
3610	Officials/Managers	6	0	5	0	0	0	1	0	0	0	0
3611	Professionals	11	Ì	7	0	2	0.	1	0	0	0	0
3612	Technicians	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
3613	Sales Workers	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
3614	Office/Clerical	8	1	4	0	1.	0	2	0	0	0	0
3615	Craft Workers (Skilled)	0	0	0	0	0	. 0	0	0	0	0	0
3616	Operatives (Semi- skilled)	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0.	0.	0
3617	Laborers (Unskilled)	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
3618	Service Workers	43	3	. 31	1	1	. 0	7	0	0	0	0
·	Totals	68	5	47	1	4	0	11	0	0	0	0

Do you use minority business as . Yes subcontractors or suppliers?

No Explain: We solicit suppliers, businesses and subcontractors from within the state of CT through emails, mailings and include those on the state's portal.

If CT based, do you post all employment of Yes openings with the State of Connecticut **Employment Service?**

Explain: Notices of openings are sent to the State Employment Service, posted on our website, sent to our provider and consumer networks and to our disability partners. Although in this

Do you use an Affirmative Action Plan? o: Yes

.No Explain; The WCAAA's AAP was adopted by the Board of Directors in 1988 and an Equal Employment Opportunity statement is also part of the Agency's Personnel Policies. Our AAP contains a clear

Describe your recruitment, hiring, training and promotion anti-discrimination practices.

Notices of our job openings are posted widespread as above. Since the WCAAA is a funder of services/programs for seniors & younger persons with disabilities, we also send notices to that mailing

The Department of Administrative Services - Business Network. Review our Privacy Policy Need to contact us? Send e-mail to DAS Web Design
All State disclaimers and permissions apply.



CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

WESTE-6 OP ID: EL

DATE (MM/DD/YYYY)

04/29/2016

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must be endorsed. If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on this certificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s). PRODUCER CONTACT Ellen Leichner Tracy-Driscoli PHONE (AIC, No. Ext): 860-314-4588 E-MAIL ADDRESS: eleichner@tracy-driscoll.com FAX (A/C, No): 860-589-6406 126 Main Street P.O.Box 2060 Bristol, CT 06011-2060 Michael Rivers INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC # INSURER A: Harleysville Insurance 14168 INSURED Western CT Area Agency INSURER B: N C C I on Aging Inc INSURER C: 84 Progress Lane Waterbury, CT 06705 INSURER D: INSURER E : INSURER F: COVERAGES **CERTIFICATE NUMBER: REVISION NUMBER:** THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS, EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS. ADDLISUBR POLICY EFF POLICY EXP
(MM/DD/YYYY) (MM/DD/YYYY) TYPE OF INSURANCE POLICY NUMBER INSD WVD Α X COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY EACH OCCURRENCE DAMAGE TO RENTED PREMISES (Ea occurrence) 1,000,000 CLAIMS-MADE X OCCUR MPA00000078260S 07/01/2015 07/01/2016 300,000 \$ 5,000 \$ MED EXP (Any one person) Sex Abuse Χ 1,000,000 PERSONAL & ADV INJURY 2,000,000 GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: GENERAL AGGREGATE \$ POLICY 2,000,000 PRODUCTS: COMP/OP AGG \$ 1,000,000 Emp Ben. OTHER: \$ COMBINED SINGLE LIMIT (Ea accident) AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY 1,000,000 BA00000084468S 07/01/2015 07/01/2016 BODILY INJURY (Per person) \$ ANY AUTO ALL OWNED AUTOS SCHEDULED. BODILY INJURY (Per accident) \$ AUTOS NON-OWNED AUTOS PROPERTY DAMAGE (Per accident) X Х HIRED AUTOS LIMBRELLA LIAR X 1,000,000 EACH OCCURRENCE \$ OCCUR **EXCESS LIAB** CM B00000078261S 07/01/2015 07/01/2016 1,000,000 AGGREGATE CLAIMS-MADE \$ \$10.00 DED X RETENTION\$ \$ WORKERS COMPENSATION X | STATUTE | AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY В 38112230 02/25/2016 02/25/2017 500,000 ANY PROPRIETORIPARTNERIEXECUTIVE OFFICERIMEMBER EXCLUDED? E.L. EACH ACCIDENT N/A 500,000 (Mandatory in NH) E.L. DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE lf yes, describe under DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below 500.000 E.L. DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule, may be attached if more space is required) CERTIFICATE HOLDER CANCELLATION SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS. Department of Social Services Alternate Care Unit 55 Farmington Ave. AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE Hartford, CT 06105